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"You were created with an internal void that only God Himself can fill." "The depth of your hunger for God
is the length of your reach to Him." "You can be as close to God as you want to be." Many of us have heard
these statements, or similar ones. Are they mere clichés? Or do they point to a truth that is so profound it
should be the main focus of our life? The mighty God of the universe is also your heavenly Father who loves
you deeply. He understands you inside and out, and He desires for you to know Him personally, too. Author
James W. Goll joyfully guides you past the clichés and into the spiritual reality of knowing God's heart
through an intentional, ongoing relationship with Him. Passionate Pursuit shows you how to open your heart
to encounter the living Lord. As your discovery of God unfolds, and your relationship with Him deepens,
you will be surprised and delighted to hear His voice, to learn from Him, and to touch His heart. You will be
filled with the life of God, and you will always desire to come back for more. In the process, you will
gradually be transformed to become like Him and to reflect His image to others. "Draw near to God and He
will draw near to you."(James 4:8)
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From reader reviews:

Carolyn Livingston:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important thing for
us to be aware of everything in the world. Each book has different aim or even goal; it means that book has
different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They are reading
whatever they acquire because their hobby is actually reading a book. Why not the person who don't like
reading a book? Sometime, person feel need book after they found difficult problem or perhaps exercise.
Well, probably you'll have this Passionate Pursuit: Getting To Know God And His Word.

Lela Hird:

This Passionate Pursuit: Getting To Know God And His Word book is not ordinary book, you have it then
the world is in your hands. The benefit you get by reading this book is actually information inside this guide
incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will get.
This Passionate Pursuit: Getting To Know God And His Word without we recognize teach the one who
reading it become critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't become worry Passionate Pursuit: Getting To
Know God And His Word can bring any time you are and not make your tote space or bookshelves' become
full because you can have it in your lovely laptop even phone. This Passionate Pursuit: Getting To Know
God And His Word having great arrangement in word along with layout, so you will not truly feel
uninterested in reading.

Helen Williams:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with close friends is thing that
usually you have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try matter that really opposite from
that. A single activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
already been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Passionate Pursuit: Getting To Know
God And His Word, you can enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you still would like to miss it?
What kind of hang type is it? Oh seriously its mind hangout people. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its
known as reading friends.

Nancy Deanda:

As a university student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the
library or to make summary for some publication, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's
spirit or real their passion. They just do what the professor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to
right now there but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring
and can't see colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important for
you personally. As we know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise
word says, many ways to reach Chinese's country. So , this Passionate Pursuit: Getting To Know God And



His Word can make you truly feel more interested to read.
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