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Set in the lead-up to the new millennium:...It's 1999, and the dreaded "Millennium Bug' is threatening
everything from the new craze of internet chatrooms, Instant Messaging, WAP mobile emails...to traffic
lights and global security. But Gary Price isn't concerned with any of this. He's only concerned with his
recent divorce, his estranged children, and his band, Black & Blue - who are on the precipice of massive
success... ...Until tragedy strikes, and Gary's plate is loaded just that little bit too full. Gary Price doesn't
know that he is insane—totally unaware of the twelve year-old personality co-existing with his adult identity.
Carlin has two sides to his sexuality, and one of them is a sadistic killer. Dr Jones carries within him the
ghost of a dead school friend. And across Internet chatrooms and continents, Carlin stalks Gary Price, to
prepare him for the doctor, who will make Gary pay dearly for a crime that is thirty years old. A deranged
school headmaster is intent on taking Gary back from the age of 42 to the age of 12. Because buried
somewhere deep in Gary’s memory is a painful guilt from a childhood accident, in which his best friend was
killed in an horrific school fire. And now the past is coming back – not so much to haunt Gary – as to make
him suffer. The enigmatic assassin known as Carlin – or GiftHorse on the Internet – will make sure of this.
For Carlin it’s merely a job. For the Headmaster whom he serves – it’s a mission of vengeance. (Contains
some adult content | This is a second edition with updated content)
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From reader reviews:

Alan Williams:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children until adult are different content. To be sure that
book is very important for us. The book Universal Language was making you to know about other expertise
and of course you can take more information. It is quite advantages for you. The reserve Universal Language
is not only giving you more new information but also for being your friend when you sense bored. You can
spend your spend time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship while using book Universal Language.
You never experience lose out for everything in case you read some books.

Janice Nolan:

Here thing why this specific Universal Language are different and trustworthy to be yours. First of all
studying a book is good nevertheless it depends in the content of it which is the content is as scrumptious as
food or not. Universal Language giving you information deeper as different ways, you can find any guide out
there but there is no e-book that similar with Universal Language. It gives you thrill examining journey, its
open up your eyes about the thing that happened in the world which is might be can be happened around you.
You can easily bring everywhere like in recreation area, café, or even in your approach home by train. For
anyone who is having difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the form of Universal Language in e-
book can be your option.

Donna Davis:

The reserve untitled Universal Language is the e-book that recommended to you to learn. You can see the
quality of the book content that will be shown to you. The language that article author use to explained their
ideas are easily to understand. The article writer was did a lot of investigation when write the book, hence the
information that they share to you personally is absolutely accurate. You also could possibly get the e-book
of Universal Language from the publisher to make you considerably more enjoy free time.

Carolyn Rolon:

You can find this Universal Language by go to the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it can to
be your solve problem if you get difficulties on your knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only
simply by written or printed but also can you enjoy this book through e-book. In the modern era such as now,
you just looking by your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your own ways
to get more information about your publication. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your
knowledge are still up-date. Let's try to choose proper ways for you.
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