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  C++ How to Program  presents leading-edge computing technologies in a friendly manner appropriate for
introductory college course sequences, based on the curriculum recommendations of two key professional
organizations—the ACM and the IEEE.

The best-selling  C++ How to Program  is accessible to readers with little or no programming experience,
yet comprehensive enough for the professional programmer. The Deitels’ signature live-code approach
presents the concepts in the context of full working programs followed by sample executions. The early
objects approach gets readers thinking about objects immediately—allowing them to more thoroughly master
the concepts. Emphasis is placed on achieving program clarity and building well-engineered software.
Interesting, entertaining, and challenging exercises encourage students to make a difference and use
computers and the Internet to work on problems. To keep readers up-to-date with leading-edge computing
technologies, the Tenth Edition conforms to the C++11 standard and the new C++14 standard.

Also available with MyProgrammingLab™
This title is also available with MyProgrammingLab–an online learning system designed to engage students
and improve results. MyProgrammingLab consists of a set of programming exercises correlated to the
programming concepts in this book. Through hundreds of practice problems, the system automatically
detects errors in the logic and syntax of their code submissions and offers targeted hints that enable students
to figure out what went wrong—and why. MyProgrammingLab improves the programming competence of
beginning students who often struggle with the basic concepts and paradigms of popular high-level
programming languages. For instructors, a comprehensive gradebook tracks correct and incorrect answers
and stores the code inputted by students for review.

Note: You are purchasing a standalone product; MyProgrammingLab does not come packaged with this
content. Students, if interested in purchasing this title with MyProgrammingLab, ask your instructor for the
correct package ISBN and Course ID. Instructors, contact your Pearson representative for more information.

If you would like to purchase both the physical text and MyProgrammingLab, search for:

0134583000 / 9780134583006 C++ How to Program Plus MyProgrammingLab with Pearson eText --
Access Card Package, 10/e
Package consists of:

0134448987 / 9780134448985 MyProgrammingLab with Pearson eText -- Access Code Card -- for C++●

How to Program (Early Objects Version)
0134448235 / 9780134448237 C++ How to Program●
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From reader reviews:

Dorothy Pierce:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As it is
known to us that book is very important for people. The book C++ How to Program (10th Edition) seemed to
be making you to know about other know-how and of course you can take more information. It is rather
advantages for you. The e-book C++ How to Program (10th Edition) is not only giving you a lot more new
information but also being your friend when you sense bored. You can spend your spend time to read your
reserve. Try to make relationship with all the book C++ How to Program (10th Edition). You never
experience lose out for everything when you read some books.

Aaron Blue:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be change about what going on or facts even
knowledge to make all of them keep up with the era that is always change and move ahead. Some of you
maybe can update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming
to you actually is you don't know what type you should start with. This C++ How to Program (10th Edition)
is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and
wish in this era.

Eldon Hall:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try issue that really opposite
from that. One activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
are ride on and with addition details. Even you love C++ How to Program (10th Edition), it is possible to
enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you still desire to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh
occur its mind hangout fellas. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its named reading friends.

David McKenney:

This C++ How to Program (10th Edition) is great book for you because the content that is full of information
for you who else always deal with world and get to make decision every minute. This kind of book reveal it
info accurately using great arrange word or we can state no rambling sentences in it. So if you are read this
hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you straight forward sentences but tough
core information with wonderful delivering sentences. Having C++ How to Program (10th Edition) in your
hand like finding the world in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous 1. We can say that no reserve that offer
you world inside ten or fifteen second right but this e-book already do that. So , this can be good reading
book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still doubt that will?
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