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A frightening, black-leather clad presence with a face like a skull--the half breed Scorpius--takes his villainy
to new heights.

"I long ago learned the advantages of patience."- Scorpius

A solo Scorpius graphic novel series, sure to excite and energize all of Farscape fandom! A frightening,
black-leather clad presence with a face like a skull--the half breed Scorpius--takes his villainy to new
heights. Crichton's worst adversary, fandom favorite villain, and one of science fictions greatest antagonists
finds himself deposed from his throne on Hyneria and making a bold new discovery that could put him back
on top of the Uncharted Territories! An excellent new entry point for Farscape fans that might have missed
the previous BOOM! Farscape graphic novels that have come before! Written by the FARSCAPE creator
Rockne S. O'Bannon and scripted by fan-favorite STAR TREK novelist David Alan Mack!
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From reader reviews:

Aline Moran:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive now, people
have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by
means of surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated the item for a while is
reading. Yep, by reading a e-book your ability to survive enhance then having chance to stand than other is
high. To suit your needs who want to start reading a new book, we give you this Farscape: Scorpius Vol 1
book as starter and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Todd Jacob:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray anyone, why because this Farscape: Scorpius Vol 1 guide written by
well-known writer who really knows well how to make book that could be understand by anyone who read
the book. Written within good manner for you, leaking every ideas and producing skill only for eliminate
your own hunger then you still doubt Farscape: Scorpius Vol 1 as good book not merely by the cover but
also by the content. This is one e-book that can break don't determine book by its deal with, so do you still
needing yet another sixth sense to pick this particular!? Oh come on your examining sixth sense already said
so why you have to listening to yet another sixth sense.

Kimberly Niemeyer:

This Farscape: Scorpius Vol 1 is new way for you who has interest to look for some information mainly
because it relief your hunger associated with. Getting deeper you into it getting knowledge more you know
otherwise you who still having little bit of digest in reading this Farscape: Scorpius Vol 1 can be the light
food to suit your needs because the information inside this kind of book is easy to get by anyone. These
books build itself in the form which is reachable by anyone, yep I mean in the e-book type. People who think
that in e-book form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this reserve is the answer. So there is not any in
reading a guide especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for a person. So ,
don't miss this! Just read this e-book style for your better life along with knowledge.

Delores Saenz:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our information for everything. By a guide we can know
everything you want. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year seemed
to be exactly added. This guide Farscape: Scorpius Vol 1 was filled with regards to science. Spend your free
time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some people has different feel when they
reading a new book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a reserve.
In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book that you wanted.
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