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Have you heard that Catherine the Great died having sex with her horse? Or perhaps you prefer the story that
Anne Boleyn had six fingers and slept with her brother? Or that Katheryn Howard slept with so many
members of the Tudor court that they couldn’t keep track of them all? As juicy and titillating as the tales
might be, they are all, patently untrue. Modern PR firms may claim that no publicity is bad publicity, but
that, too, is untrue. The fact that Cleopatra is better known for her seductions than her statecraft, and that
Jezebel is remembered as a painted trollop rather than a faithful wife and religiously devout queen, isn’t a
way for historians to keep these interesting women in the public eye, rather it’s a subversion of their power, a
re-writing of history to belittle and shame these powerful figures, preventing them from becoming icons of
feminine strength and capability. Slut shaming has its roots in our earliest history, but it continues to flourish
in our supposedly post-feminist, equal-rights world. It is used to punish women for transgressions against
gender norms, threatening the security of their place in society and warning that they’d better be “good girls”
and not rock the patriarchal boat, or they, too could end up with people believing they’ve slept with
everything from farm animals to relatives. This is The Jezebel Effect
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From reader reviews:

Patricia Smith:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you can have it in
e-book technique, more simple and reachable. This particular The Jezebel Effect: Why the Slut Shaming of
Famous Queens Still Matters can give you a lot of pals because by you checking out this one book you have
matter that they don't and make an individual more like an interesting person. That book can be one of a step
for you to get success. This publication offer you information that probably your friend doesn't know, by
knowing more than different make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? We should have The
Jezebel Effect: Why the Slut Shaming of Famous Queens Still Matters.

Laverne Jackson:

You can obtain this The Jezebel Effect: Why the Slut Shaming of Famous Queens Still Matters by go to the
bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it could to be your solve difficulty if you get difficulties
for ones knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only simply by written or printed but can you
enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern era such as now, you just looking by your local mobile phone and
searching what your problem. Right now, choose your current ways to get more information about your
publication. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still revise. Let's try to
choose correct ways for you.

Maria Lamotte:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. This kind of book The Jezebel Effect: Why the Slut Shaming of
Famous Queens Still Matters was multi-colored and of course has pictures around. As we know that book
The Jezebel Effect: Why the Slut Shaming of Famous Queens Still Matters has many kinds or genre. Start
from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and believe that you
are the character on there. So , not at all of book are usually make you bored, any it makes you feel happy,
fun and relax. Try to choose the best book for you and try to like reading that.

Edna Dixon:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
from a book. Book is prepared or printed or descriptive from each source in which filled update of news.
With this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From media
social similar to newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic.
You can add your understanding by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to spread out your
book? Or just in search of the The Jezebel Effect: Why the Slut Shaming of Famous Queens Still Matters
when you necessary it?
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