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Virtually every area of research associated with sharks and their relatives has been strongly impacted by the
revolutionary growth in technology. The questions we can now ask are very different than those reported
even two decades ago. Modern immunological and genetic techniques, satellite telemetry and archival
tagging, modern phylogenetic analysis, GIS, and bomb dating, are just a few of the techniques and
procedures that have become a part of our investigative lexicon.

A modern synthesis of the biology of Chondrichthyans, Biology of Sharks and Their Relatives, Second
Edition discusses significant advances in the development and application of new molecular techniques to
the understanding of the phylogenetic relationships among and between these groups. The book considers the
effect of global changes on the status of sharks and their relatives, and how advances in technology and
analytical techniques have changed not only how we approach problem solving and scientific investigations,
but how we formulate questions. The book also introduces applications of new and novel laboratory devices,
techniques, and field instruments.

This second edition of the award winning and groundbreaking original exploration of the fundamental
elements of the taxonomy, systematics, physiology, and ecology of sharks, skates, rays, and chimera,
presents cohesive and integrated coverage of key topics and discusses technological advances used in
modern shark research. Offering a well-rounded picture for students and researchers, and far above
competitors in scope and research, this new volume holds a wealth of data on the current status of
Chondrichthyan research and provides the basis and springboard for original research.
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From reader reviews:

Susie Vadnais:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important
thing for us to understand everything in the world. Each book has different aim as well as goal; it means that
e-book has different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. These
are reading whatever they acquire because their hobby is reading a book. Why not the person who don't like
looking at a book? Sometime, person feel need book if they found difficult problem as well as exercise.
Well, probably you should have this Biology of Sharks and Their Relatives, Second Edition (CRC Marine
Biology Series).

Samuel Rascon:

Within other case, little individuals like to read book Biology of Sharks and Their Relatives, Second Edition
(CRC Marine Biology Series). You can choose the best book if you love reading a book. Given that we know
about how is important a new book Biology of Sharks and Their Relatives, Second Edition (CRC Marine
Biology Series). You can add knowledge and of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely
right, due to the fact from book you can learn everything! From your country until finally foreign or abroad
you will find yourself known. About simple issue until wonderful thing it is possible to know that. In this
era, we could open a book or searching by internet system. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel
fed up to go to the library. Let's learn.

Nancy Page:

The e-book untitled Biology of Sharks and Their Relatives, Second Edition (CRC Marine Biology Series) is
the book that recommended to you you just read. You can see the quality of the reserve content that will be
shown to anyone. The language that publisher use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The
author was did a lot of analysis when write the book, hence the information that they share for you is
absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book of Biology of Sharks and Their Relatives, Second Edition
(CRC Marine Biology Series) from the publisher to make you considerably more enjoy free time.

Luther Keller:

Is it you actually who having spare time then spend it whole day by means of watching television programs
or just resting on the bed? Do you need something new? This Biology of Sharks and Their Relatives, Second
Edition (CRC Marine Biology Series) can be the answer, oh how comes? A book you know. You are and so
out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So
what these guides have than the others?
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