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Pauline Maier shows us the Declaration as both the defining statement of our national identity and the moral
standard by which we live as a nation. It is truly "American Scripture," and Maier tells us how it came to be -
- from the Declaration's birth in the hard and tortuous struggle by which Americans arrived at Independence
to the ways in which, in the nineteenth century, the document itself became sanctified.

Maier describes the transformation of the Second Continental Congress into a national government, unlike
anything that preceded or followed it, and with more authority than the colonists would ever have conceded
to the British Parliament; the great difficulty in making the decision for Independence; the influence of
Paine's Common Sense, which shifted the terms of debate; and the political maneuvers that allowed Congress
to make the momentous decision.

In Maier's hands, the Declaration of Independence is brought close to us. She lets us hear the voice of the
people as revealed in the other "declarations" of 1776: the local resolutions -- most of which have gone
unnoticed over the past two centuries -- that explained, advocated, and justified Independence and
undergirded Congress's work. Detective-like, she discloses the origins of key ideas and phrases in the
Declaration and unravels the complex story of its drafting and of the group-editing job which angered
Thomas Jefferson.

Maier also reveals what happened to the Declaration after the signing and celebration: how it was largely
forgotten and then revived to buttress political arguments of the nineteenth century; and, most important,
how Abraham Lincoln ensured its persistence as a living force in American society. Finally, she shows how
by the very act of venerating the Declaration as we do -- by holding it as sacrosanct, akin to holy writ -- we
may actually be betraying its purpose and its power.
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From reader reviews:

Tiara Arnold:

This American Scripture: Making the Declaration of Independence book is not ordinary book, you have it
then the world is in your hands. The benefit you get by reading this book is information inside this e-book
incredible fresh, you will get data which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will get.
This specific American Scripture: Making the Declaration of Independence without we comprehend teach
the one who reading it become critical in pondering and analyzing. Don't be worry American Scripture:
Making the Declaration of Independence can bring when you are and not make your bag space or
bookshelves' become full because you can have it in your lovely laptop even phone. This American
Scripture: Making the Declaration of Independence having fine arrangement in word and also layout, so you
will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Tracey Egan:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information currently can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a knowledge or any news even an issue. What people must be consider
when those information which is inside the former life are challenging to be find than now's taking seriously
which one works to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you receive the unstable
resource then you obtain it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All of those
possibilities will not happen within you if you take American Scripture: Making the Declaration of
Independence as the daily resource information.

Raymond Lee:

You are able to spend your free time to see this book this book. This American Scripture: Making the
Declaration of Independence is simple to deliver you can read it in the area, in the beach, train as well as
soon. If you did not have much space to bring often the printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is
make you simpler to read it. You can save the book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits
that you will get when one buys this book.

Walter Son:

Is it you who having spare time and then spend it whole day by watching television programs or just lying
down on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This American Scripture: Making the Declaration of
Independence can be the respond to, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are so out of date,
spending your extra time by reading in this completely new era is common not a geek activity. So what these
ebooks have than the others?
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