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Although Cora Du Bois began her life in the early twentieth century as a lonely and awkward girl, her
intellect and curiosity propelled her into a remarkable life as an anthropologist and diplomat in the vanguard
of social and academic change.

Du Bois studied with Franz Boas, a founder of American anthropology, and with some of his most eminent
students: Ruth Benedict, Alfred Kroeber, and Robert Lowie. During World War II, she served as a high-
ranking officer for the Office of Strategic Services as the only woman to head one of the OSS branches of
intelligence, Research and Analysis in Southeast Asia. After the war she joined the State Department as chief
of the Southeast Asia Branch of the Division of Research for the Far East. She was also the first female full
professor, with tenure, appointed at Harvard University and became president of the American
Anthropological Association.

Du Bois worked to keep her public and private lives separate, especially while facing the FBI’s harassment
as an opponent of U.S. engagements in Vietnam and as a “liberal” lesbian during the McCarthy era. Susan C.
Seymour’s biography weaves together Du Bois’s personal and professional lives to illustrate this exceptional
“first woman” and the complexities of the twentieth century that she both experienced and influenced.
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From reader reviews:

Thomas Welty:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material if you want
something to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy man or
woman? If you don't have spare time to perform others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you
have time? What did you do? Every person has many questions above. They need to answer that question
because just their can do which. It said that about guide. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is suitable.
Because start from on pre-school until university need this Cora Du Bois: Anthropologist, Diplomat, Agent
(Critical Studies in the History of Anthropology) to read.

William Stewart:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make someone
to understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information much easier to
share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon. You can
observe that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The particular book that recommended for
you is Cora Du Bois: Anthropologist, Diplomat, Agent (Critical Studies in the History of Anthropology) this
guide consist a lot of the information of the condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented
how can the world has grown up. The words styles that writer make usage of to explain it is easy to
understand. Typically the writer made some analysis when he makes this book. This is why this book
suitable all of you.

Mae Mosley:

In this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability in doing something more are more valuable
than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you must
do is just spending your time little but quite enough to possess a look at some books. One of several books in
the top listing in your reading list will be Cora Du Bois: Anthropologist, Diplomat, Agent (Critical Studies in
the History of Anthropology). This book that is qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in
growing to be precious person. By looking upwards and review this guide you can get many advantages.

Richelle Johnson:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book had been rare?
Why so many problem for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading.
Some people likes looking at, not only science book but novel and Cora Du Bois: Anthropologist, Diplomat,
Agent (Critical Studies in the History of Anthropology) or others sources were given know-how for you.
After you know how the truly great a book, you feel need to read more and more. Science e-book was
created for teacher or students especially. Those textbooks are helping them to bring their knowledge. In
various other case, beside science e-book, any other book likes Cora Du Bois: Anthropologist, Diplomat,



Agent (Critical Studies in the History of Anthropology) to make your spare time much more colorful. Many
types of book like this.
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