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President George W. Bush has told all Americans that the war against terrorism would be like no other war.
But what does this mean? Who will fight? How will they fight? What weapons will be used? Most informed
commentators agree that the war against terrorism will be fought largely by "special forces"—that is, by a
relatively new community within the American military known as Special Operations Forces, or SOF's. This
new "branch" of the armed forces was created in the mid–1980s and is organized under its own unified
command, called U.S. Special Operations Command (SOCOM). Consisting of special units from the other
branches of the armed forces, such as Green Berets, Rangers, SEALs, and Delta Force, this new fighting
command is recognized internationally as the most well-trained and well-equipped special operations force
in the world. Their missions are varied—including combat terrorism, search and rescue, reconnaissance,
humanitarian assistance, peacekeeping duty, and conventional and unconventional warfare.Despite special
forces’ international reputation for excellence, Americans know little about this remarkable fighting force.
U.S. Special Forces provides a handy and comprehensive compendium, including descriptions of the units
and their operational specialties, training, and organization, as well as the equipment and technological
gadgetry, weapons, armor, planes, helicopters, and support vehicles used by each unit.
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From reader reviews:

James Lapham:

The book U.S. Special Forces: A Guide to America's Special Operations Units-The World's Most Elite
Fighting Force make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You can utilize to make your capable a lot more
increase. Book can to be your best friend when you getting pressure or having big problem with the subject.
If you can make examining a book U.S. Special Forces: A Guide to America's Special Operations Units-The
World's Most Elite Fighting Force to be your habit, you can get far more advantages, like add your own
capable, increase your knowledge about a number of or all subjects. You may know everything if you like
wide open and read a publication U.S. Special Forces: A Guide to America's Special Operations Units-The
World's Most Elite Fighting Force. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science reserve or encyclopedia
or other folks. So , how do you think about this guide?

Eric Johnson:

This book untitled U.S. Special Forces: A Guide to America's Special Operations Units-The World's Most
Elite Fighting Force to be one of several books which best seller in this year, honestly, that is because when
you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to buy that book in the book store or
you can order it by using online. The publisher with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to
read this book, because you can read this book in your Smartphone. So there is no reason for your
requirements to past this book from your list.

Mary Fleming:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got learners? We believe that that question was
given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And you also know
that little person similar to reading or as reading become their hobby. You must know that reading is very
important along with book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to include you knowledge, except your
teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update in relation to something by book. Different categories
of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is actually U.S. Special Forces: A Guide to
America's Special Operations Units-The World's Most Elite Fighting Force.

Shay Price:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
from your book. Book is written or printed or descriptive from each source in which filled update of news. In
this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social including
newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You can add your
knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just seeking the U.S.
Special Forces: A Guide to America's Special Operations Units-The World's Most Elite Fighting Force when
you required it?
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