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At the center of "Noli Me Tangere (Touch Me Not)" by Philippine national hero José Rizal is the conflict
against Spanish colonialism. The Philippines, which is named after King Philip II of Spain, was ruled by the
Spanish empire as a colony from 1565 until the Philippine Revolution ended this rule in 1898. For his part in
the Philippine Revolution, José Rizal was tried and convicted for rebellion, sedition, and conspiracy. His
sentence was to be death by firing squad. Juan Crisóstomo Ibarra, the main character of "Noli Me Tangere
(Touch Me Not)", returns to the Phillipines after a seven year absence studying in Europe. He is betrothed to
the María Clara, the beautiful daughter of Captain Tiago. With this work Rizal set out to write a novel that
would expose the ills of Philippine society and in so doing created a passionate love story set against the
backdrop of the political conflict against a repressive regime. "Noli Me Tangere (Touch Me Not)" and its
sequel "El Filibusterismo" are exceptional firsthand documents of the real struggles faced by the Philippine
peoples at the end of the 19th century.
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From reader reviews:

Cami Raley:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the headline Noli Me Tangere
(Touch Me Not) suitable to you? The book was written by well-known writer in this era. The actual book
untitled Noli Me Tangere (Touch Me Not)is a single of several books that will everyone read now. This kind
of book was inspired many people in the world. When you read this book you will enter the new shape that
you ever know prior to. The author explained their plan in the simple way, therefore all of people can easily
to understand the core of this guide. This book will give you a large amount of information about this world
now. To help you to see the represented of the world on this book.

Christopher Arnold:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With looking at you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can easily share their
idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their own reader with their story or
perhaps their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the guides. But also they write about the
knowledge about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
children, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on earth always try to improve their talent
in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write to their book. One of them is this Noli Me
Tangere (Touch Me Not).

Theresa Collins:

Would you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Attempt to
pick one book that you find out the inside because don't determine book by its protect may doesn't work is
difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the outside search
likes. Maybe you answer can be Noli Me Tangere (Touch Me Not) why because the fantastic cover that
make you consider regarding the content will not disappoint an individual. The inside or content will be
fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.

Ricardo Huddle:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside together with friends, fun activity having family
or just watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by reading a book.
Ugh, do you consider reading a book will surely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It okay
you can have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Noli Me Tangere
(Touch Me Not) which is getting the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's observe.
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