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Missions is the work of the church to reach and teach the peoples of the world for Christ’s sake. The
missionary call is a vital part of the life of every follower of Jesus Christ and, therefore, the church. But the
effective discipleship of all nations requires a solid biblical, historical, and practical foundation. Therefore,
the study of missiology demands the effective application of biblical studies, theology, and history.

This text brings the rich heritage of evangelical missiology founded on conservative theology to a twenty-
first century audience passionate for the proclamation of the gospel. Introduction to Global Missions brings
the authors’ decades of combined missionary and teaching experience to a survey text appropriate for college
or seminary classroom.

The book is divided into four sections and thirteen chapters. The text begins with the biblical and theological
foundations of Christian missions, including a biblical theology of missions. Before moving to the practical
and strategic issues of twenty-first century missions, the authors consider the historical development of
missions with a view toward providing a basis for contemporary strategies. A final foundational set of
chapters addresses the impact of cultures on the communication of the gospel. The remainder of the text
deals with key issues and opportunities in missions, including church planting, missions in the local church,
and strategies for disciple-making.

Introduction to Global Missions provides a foundation for readers to consider their own missionary call,
whether as a full-time field missionary or a church member on short-term projects. No matter their role,
Great Commission Christians need a framework for doing missions well.
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From reader reviews:

Angel Echols:

Inside other case, little people like to read book Introduction to Global Missions. You can choose the best
book if you appreciate reading a book. Provided that we know about how is important some sort of book
Introduction to Global Missions. You can add expertise and of course you can around the world by the book.
Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can realize everything! From your country until finally
foreign or abroad you will end up known. About simple issue until wonderful thing you can know that. In
this era, you can open a book as well as searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when
you feel fed up to go to the library. Let's read.

Catherine Nelson:

Book is usually written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
reserve. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important thing to bring us around the
world. Adjacent to that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A book Introduction to Global Missions
will make you to always be smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about every little
thing. But some of you think in which open or reading some sort of book make you bored. It's not make you
fun. Why they can be thought like that? Have you searching for best book or suited book with you?

Dewey Rascon:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the title Introduction to Global
Missions suitable to you? Typically the book was written by popular writer in this era. Typically the book
untitled Introduction to Global Missionsis the one of several books which everyone read now. That book was
inspired a number of people in the world. When you read this reserve you will enter the new dimensions that
you ever know before. The author explained their plan in the simple way, consequently all of people can
easily to know the core of this guide. This book will give you a large amount of information about this world
now. So that you can see the represented of the world on this book.

Daniel Pitts:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got students? We believe that that query was
given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And you know that
little person just like reading or as examining become their hobby. You need to understand that reading is
very important as well as book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge, except
your own personal teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update regarding something by book.
Numerous books that can you take to be your object. One of them is Introduction to Global Missions.
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