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Deep within your soul, you’ve yearned for the ability to clearly hear God's Voice. The Voice for Love is the
answer to your prayer.

Tapping into this Source of Loving Guidance and Wisdom is your God-given birthright. The secret of
connecting to what many have called the Holy Spirit has long been shrouded in mystery. For the first time,
The Voice for Love reveals the step-by-step keys to unlocking this Presence of God within you as a distinct
and clear Inner Voice.

The Voice for Love will empower you to uncover and develop your greatest potential, experience true
healing and peace, receive answers to your life-long questions, discover your unique purpose in the world,
and access the inner guidance, comfort, and connection you truly seek.

“At a time when many of the ‘spiritual’ books coming forth are really spiritual fantasy and fiction, The Voice
for Love arrives as a true educative manual for the student devoted to hearing the Voice of God within.
DavidPaul and Candace are emerging as two of the best educators in the spiritual community.” Diane
Youngs, Director of the Shanti Christo Foundation, Publisher of The Way of Mastery

“I've shared with our church congregation that this is the best book I have read on HOW to be in
communication with God. I couldn't put the book down because it was so easy to understand and such joyful
reading. Not only did I receive communication within, but the concepts are the way to live a joyous life. I
will be practicing daily to be in dialogue with Spirit. Thank you for helping me to discover my Divine
Voice!” Rev. Susan EngPoole, Unity Church of Louisville, KY

"Filled with Truth and inspiration throughout, this wonderful book brings insight and clarity to hearing
God’s Voice within!" James Twyman, Peace Troubadour and author of Emissary of Light

DavidPaul and Candace Doyle have taught tens of thousands of people how to access the Voice of God
within them. Regardless of what you call this Inner Wisdom—God's Voice, Holy Spirit, still small voice
within—joining with and using this Voice in your life creates the power to give you everything you truly
seek. DavidPaul and Candace live in Ashland, Oregon with their daughter, Hannah.

What Readers Are Saying

"I had my first Kundalini and Siddhi experience while reading the pages of The Voice for Love book. As a
scientist, educator, and healer, I give high regards to physical and demonstrable evidences. I feel that this
book is a profound work of spirituality." Alex E. Etemad, MD Anaheim, CA

"I purchased your book several weeks ago. It arrived in the mail. I unwrapped it, looked at it, and thought,
"Why did I ever buy this?" It sat on the bookshelf and sat on the bookshelf, until one day, I picked it up and
could not put it down. It's incredible! Thank You. Thank You. Thank You!" Wanda Anderson, Salem, WA



"The Voice for Love has become my inspiration, comforter, and goal ... my inspiration for counseling
sessions with others, my comforter when I doubt and judge myself, and my daily goal in print. I have one
copy in the kitchen and one in the car to be with me everywhere I go!" Rita Hoegel, NSW, Australia

"For anyone wishing to hear or strengthen their connection with that still small voice within, this book is a
"MUST READ." DavidPaul and Candace expertly and lovingly coach the reader inward to their own endless
font of knowledge and guidance. It is a beautiful, kind, gentle, and very wise book. Just the reading of it
brought me to such a quiet and peaceful place." Audrey Lloyd, Port Orange, Florida

"I thoroughly enjoyed The Voice for Love. It is a delightful book that not only illuminates Truth, but does so
with a rare simplicity and ease. An excellent guide on the journey of the soul." Jayem, scribe for The Way of
Mastery
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From reader reviews:

Patricia Ables:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important act, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add
your knowledge by the book entitled The Voice for Love: Accessing Your Inner Voice To Fulfill Your Life's
Purpose. Try to make the book The Voice for Love: Accessing Your Inner Voice To Fulfill Your Life's
Purpose as your close friend. It means that it can for being your friend when you sense alone and beside
associated with course make you smarter than ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book makes
you considerably more confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , let me make new
experience in addition to knowledge with this book.

Joshua Mendez:

The book The Voice for Love: Accessing Your Inner Voice To Fulfill Your Life's Purpose can give more
knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. Exactly why must we leave
a very important thing like a book The Voice for Love: Accessing Your Inner Voice To Fulfill Your Life's
Purpose? A number of you have a different opinion about guide. But one aim which book can give many
information for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge or details
that you take for that, you could give for each other; it is possible to share all of these. Book The Voice for
Love: Accessing Your Inner Voice To Fulfill Your Life's Purpose has simple shape however you know: it
has great and large function for you. You can look the enormous world by open and read a e-book. So it is
very wonderful.

Kathleen King:

Do you one among people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold on
guys this particular aren't like that. This The Voice for Love: Accessing Your Inner Voice To Fulfill Your
Life's Purpose book is readable by means of you who hate those perfect word style. You will find the
information here are arrange for enjoyable reading experience without leaving even decrease the knowledge
that want to provide to you. The writer connected with The Voice for Love: Accessing Your Inner Voice To
Fulfill Your Life's Purpose content conveys thinking easily to understand by most people. The printed and e-
book are not different in the content material but it just different in the form of it. So , do you still thinking
The Voice for Love: Accessing Your Inner Voice To Fulfill Your Life's Purpose is not loveable to be your
top list reading book?

Joseph Mattie:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With looking at you can
get a lot of information that can give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world can
easily share their idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their particular



reader with their story or their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the publications. But also they
write about advantage about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to
teach your young ones, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors these days always try to
improve their expertise in writing, they also doing some research before they write for their book. One of
them is this The Voice for Love: Accessing Your Inner Voice To Fulfill Your Life's Purpose.
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