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Java developers typically go through four "stages" in mastering Java. In the first stage, they learn the
language itself. In the second stage, they study the APIs. In the third stage, they become proficient in the
environment. It is in the fourth stage --"the expert stage"-- where things really get interesting, and Java
Enterprise Best Practices is the tangible compendium of experience that developers need to breeze through
this fourth and final stage of Enterprise Java mastery.Crammed with tips and tricks, Java Enterprise Best
Practices distills years of solid experience from eleven experts in the J2EE environment into a practical, to-
the-point guide to J2EE.Java Enterprise Best Practices gives developers the unvarnished, expert-tested
advice that the man pages don't provide--what areas of the APIs should be used frequently (and which are
better avoided); elegant solutions to problems you face that other developers have already discovered; what
things you should always do, what things you should consider doing, and what things you should never do--
even if the documentation says it's ok.Until Java Enterprise Best Practices, Java developers in the fourth
stage of mastery relied on the advice of a loose-knit community of fellow developers, time-consuming online
searches for examples or suggestions for the immediate problem they faced, and tedious trial-and-error. But
Java has grown to include a huge number of APIs, classes, and methods. Now it is simply too large for even
the most intrepid developer to know it all. The need for a written compendium of J2EE Best Practices has
never been greater.Java Enterprise Best Practices focuses on the Java 2 Enterprise Edition (J2EE) APIs. The
J2EE APIs include such alphabet soup acronyms as EJB, JDBC, RMI, XML, and JMX.
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From reader reviews:

David Browning:

What do you consider book? It is just for students as they are still students or it for all people in the world,
what best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that concern above. Every person has different
personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they don't would like
do that. You must know how great and also important the book Java Enterprise Best Practices. All type of
book would you see on many methods. You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Tammy Medina:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
thus. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a book will give you a lot of new data.
When you read a guide you will get new information mainly because book is one of many ways to share the
information as well as their idea. Second, reading a book will make an individual more imaginative. When
you examining a book especially fictional works book the author will bring someone to imagine the story
how the characters do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to others. When you read this Java
Enterprise Best Practices, you can tells your family, friends in addition to soon about yours publication. Your
knowledge can inspire the mediocre, make them reading a publication.

Ricky Bodkin:

The e-book with title Java Enterprise Best Practices has a lot of information that you can understand it. You
can get a lot of advantage after read this book. This specific book exist new understanding the information
that exist in this book represented the condition of the world right now. That is important to yo7u to know
how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you inside new era of the the positive effect.
You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you want.

Margarita Culbertson:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you may have it in e-
book method, more simple and reachable. This specific Java Enterprise Best Practices can give you a lot of
pals because by you taking a look at this one book you have factor that they don't and make you actually
more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of a step for you to get success. This e-book
offer you information that possibly your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than other make you to
be great folks. So , why hesitate? We need to have Java Enterprise Best Practices.
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