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The Goldfinch –Donna Tartt: A Detailed Summary And Analysis Of
The Novel!

The Goldfinch is a life drama fiction novel written by an American writer Donna Tartt.
Donna Tart was born on December 23rd 1963 in Greenwood, Mississippi and she is a writer of some other
novels such as The Secret History and The Little Friend. Tartt received Pulitzer’s Prize for Fiction in 2014
for her novel The Goldfinch. She has been active writer since 1992. Her previous novels (The Little Friend
and The Secret History) have been translated to thirty languages.
The novel itself revolves around the young boy named Theodore (Theo) Decker and the painting named ‘The
Goldfinch’. One day, Theo accompanies his mother to the Metropolitan Museum of Art. There, he sees a
strange and striking red-headed girl. While he is thinking about the girl, terrorists attack the Museum, his
mother dies, he is somehow able to survive the attack, and he thus he steals ( although ‘’accidentally’’ ) one
of the paintings named- the Goldfinch, and after that, he flees the building. After these events Theo lives a
dangerous and often very risky life- he becomes friend with the criminals, he sells counterfeit antiques, he
gets engaged with the girl he does not love and finally- he even kills a man. The story itself begins in the first
perspective, as its main protagonist (Theo himself) tells the readers the story of his life. From the first part of
the story, we can see Tartt’s fine ability to retrospect the story as she draws the reader to the story from the
moment he begins to read the novel.
The Goldfinch is seven hundreds and seventy one page long novel, but once you start reading it and once
you become captivated by the story and its complex characters the novel will seem a lot shorter. Some of the
parts will maybe seem a bit boring and unnecessary too prolonged, but for the most of it, the novel will offer
to you an exciting adventure worth of reading. Similar to her previous work The Secret History, The
Goldfinch also revolves around one crucial event of the novel accompanied by some bad decisions that the
characters made at the beginning or during the course of the novel.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Beck:

What do you about book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you want something to
explain what yours problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy person? If you don't have spare
time to do others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have spare time? What did you do?
Every person has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that question because just their can do
that. It said that about book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is proper. Because start from on
guardería until university need that The Goldfinch: An Amazing Summary & Analysis About This Book of
Donna Tartt!! (BONUS: FUN QUIZZES TO HELP YOU LEARN THE GOLDFINCH) (The Goldfinch: An
Amazing ... Analysis; Paperback, Audiobook, A Novel) to read.

Larry Witcher:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information currently can get by anyone at
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider when those information which is in the former life are challenging to be find than now could be
taking seriously which one works to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you have
the unstable resource then you buy it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen in you if you take The Goldfinch: An Amazing Summary & Analysis
About This Book of Donna Tartt!! (BONUS: FUN QUIZZES TO HELP YOU LEARN THE GOLDFINCH)
(The Goldfinch: An Amazing ... Analysis; Paperback, Audiobook, A Novel) as your daily resource
information.

David Miller:

Reading can called imagination hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book particularly book entitled
The Goldfinch: An Amazing Summary & Analysis About This Book of Donna Tartt!! (BONUS: FUN
QUIZZES TO HELP YOU LEARN THE GOLDFINCH) (The Goldfinch: An Amazing ... Analysis;
Paperback, Audiobook, A Novel) your head will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each and
every aspect that maybe unidentified for but surely can be your mind friends. Imaging each and every word
written in a e-book then become one type conclusion and explanation that maybe you never get prior to. The
The Goldfinch: An Amazing Summary & Analysis About This Book of Donna Tartt!! (BONUS: FUN
QUIZZES TO HELP YOU LEARN THE GOLDFINCH) (The Goldfinch: An Amazing ... Analysis;
Paperback, Audiobook, A Novel) giving you yet another experience more than blown away the mind but
also giving you useful details for your better life with this era. So now let us demonstrate the relaxing pattern
this is your body and mind will be pleased when you are finished studying it, like winning an activity. Do
you want to try this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?



Isaiah Owens:

You can spend your free time to study this book this publication. This The Goldfinch: An Amazing
Summary & Analysis About This Book of Donna Tartt!! (BONUS: FUN QUIZZES TO HELP YOU
LEARN THE GOLDFINCH) (The Goldfinch: An Amazing ... Analysis; Paperback, Audiobook, A Novel) is
simple to develop you can read it in the park, in the beach, train along with soon. If you did not have got
much space to bring the printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You
can save the actual book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you
buy this book.
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