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Learn How to Properly Analyze Categorical Data
Analysis of Categorical Data with R presents a modern account of categorical data analysis using the
popular R software. It covers recent techniques of model building and assessment for binary, multicategory,
and count response variables and discusses fundamentals, such as odds ratio and probability estimation. The
authors give detailed advice and guidelines on which procedures to use and why to use them.

The Use of R as Both a Data Analysis Method and a Learning Tool
Requiring no prior experience with R, the text offers an introduction to the essential features and functions of
R. It incorporates numerous examples from medicine, psychology, sports, ecology, and other areas, along
with extensive R code and output. The authors use data simulation in R to help readers understand the
underlying assumptions of a procedure and then to evaluate the procedure’s performance. They also present
many graphical demonstrations of the features and properties of various analysis methods.

Web Resource
The data sets and R programs from each example are available at www.chrisbilder.com/categorical. The
programs include code used to create every plot and piece of output. Many of these programs contain code to
demonstrate additional features or to perform more detailed analyses than what is in the text. Designed to be
used in tandem with the book, the website also uniquely provides videos of the authors teaching a course on
the subject. These videos include live, in-class recordings, which instructors may find useful in a blended or
flipped classroom setting. The videos are also suitable as a substitute for a short course.
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From reader reviews:

Stuart Ross:

Reading a book tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information that could give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can easily share their
idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire their reader with their story as
well as their experience. Not only situation that share in the ebooks. But also they write about advantage
about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your sons or
daughters, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors in this world always try to improve their
proficiency in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write to their book. One of them is this
Analysis of Categorical Data with R (Chapman & Hall/CRC Texts in Statistical Science).

Robin Millard:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Try and pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't evaluate book by its deal with may
doesn't work this is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as
in the outside seem likes. Maybe you answer is usually Analysis of Categorical Data with R (Chapman &
Hall/CRC Texts in Statistical Science) why because the wonderful cover that make you consider in regards
to the content will not disappoint a person. The inside or content is actually fantastic as the outside or maybe
cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.

Arlene Farrar:

This Analysis of Categorical Data with R (Chapman & Hall/CRC Texts in Statistical Science) is great book
for you because the content and that is full of information for you who also always deal with world and have
to make decision every minute. This specific book reveal it info accurately using great arrange word or we
can say no rambling sentences within it. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have whole information in it.
Doesn't mean it only provides straight forward sentences but tricky core information with splendid delivering
sentences. Having Analysis of Categorical Data with R (Chapman & Hall/CRC Texts in Statistical Science)
in your hand like having the world in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous one particular. We can say that no
reserve that offer you world inside ten or fifteen tiny right but this publication already do that. So , this is
good reading book. Hey there Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt that will?

Roland Collins:

Is it you actually who having spare time and then spend it whole day by watching television programs or just
resting on the bed? Do you need something new? This Analysis of Categorical Data with R (Chapman &
Hall/CRC Texts in Statistical Science) can be the reply, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are so
out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these
guides have than the others?
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