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As one of the top folk musicians in the country, Christine Lavin has seen it all--and she still loves the music
and the life she feels privileged to lead. Published in honor of her twenty-fifth anniversary as a full-time,
independent touring musician, Cold Pizza for Breakfast: A Mem-wha? is a memoir of road stories and
adventures across the United States, Canada, and Australia. ''I've changed a few names to spare hurt
feelings,'' Christine notes, ''but all these stories are true. Hey, I have eight brothers and sisters--you think
they'd let me make things up?''

Cold Pizza for Breakfast is rich with details from two-plus decades of songwriting and performing. The
memoir begins with the hysterical tale of Christine's being booed in West Palm Beach when she opened for
Joan Rivers--with a coda that demonstrates Christine's nimble mind and sense of the absurd--and recounts
her circuitous route to becoming one of folk music's most respected and beloved songwriters and performers.
Christine explains: ''Instead of a business plan, I've followed hunches, my intuition, and my heart, and I have
had the good fortune of meeting astounding people along the way who helped point me in the right direction.
OK, a few pointed me in the wrong direction, too. But I always somehow managed to recover.''

Christine is an engaging and generous writer, often putting an informative and warm spotlight on other
musicians. Learn delicious details about Dave Van Ronk's unique method of writing music, the stanza of a
famous song that Bob Dylan had never heard, and how Ervin Drake came to write ''It Was a Very Good
Year.'' Read about the unlikely beginnings of the folk super-group ''The Four Bitchin' Babes,'' still going
strong today, and how Christine's music has found a home with some of today's brightest Broadway stars.

Photographs and memorabilia from Christine's fantastic voyage, song lyrics, an extensive appendix including
an index and Christine's list of her 1,000 favorite songs that she has played while guest-DJing in New York
City--all this combines with Christine's incomparable sense of humor to make Cold Pizza for Breakfast: A
Mem-wha? an irresistible read and an invaluable resource for anyone who is interested in how songs get
made, how musicians learn, and the business of music.
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From reader reviews:

Alfredo Dunn:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you really need
something to explain what you problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy man or woman? If
you don't have spare time to do others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And you have
free time? What did you do? Everybody has many questions above. They need to answer that question
because just their can do which. It said that about book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is proper.
Because start from on guardería until university need this Cold Pizza for Breakfast: A Mem-wha? to read.

David Barthel:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
so. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a book will give you a lot of new facts. When
you read a book you will get new information simply because book is one of various ways to share the
information or their idea. Second, reading through a book will make anyone more imaginative. When you
reading a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the story how the
characters do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to other people. When you read this Cold
Pizza for Breakfast: A Mem-wha?, you may tells your family, friends and also soon about yours publication.
Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a publication.

Sylvia Kirby:

The publication untitled Cold Pizza for Breakfast: A Mem-wha? is the guide that recommended to you to
see. You can see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to you. The language that publisher use
to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The author was did a lot of exploration
when write the book, to ensure the information that they share for your requirements is absolutely accurate.
You also could possibly get the e-book of Cold Pizza for Breakfast: A Mem-wha? from the publisher to
make you more enjoy free time.

Edgar Workman:

Cold Pizza for Breakfast: A Mem-wha? can be one of your beginner books that are good idea. All of us
recommend that straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary that could increase your knowledge
in terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information. The article writer giving
his/her effort to set every word into joy arrangement in writing Cold Pizza for Breakfast: A Mem-wha? but
doesn't forget the main level, giving the reader the hottest in addition to based confirm resource info that
maybe you can be considered one of it. This great information can certainly drawn you into new stage of
crucial considering.
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