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Through strange metaphysical circumstances, failed screenwriter Brad Cohen finds himself caught in an
infinite time loop, forced to relive the first forty years of his life again and again. Each “repeat,” Brad wakes
up in the womb on what was supposed to be his fortieth birthday, with full knowledge of what’s come
before. In various timelines, he becomes a successful political pundit, a game-show champion, a playboy,
and a master manipulator of the stock market, but none of them seem to lead him out of his predicament. As
he realizes he wants to break out of the loop and find the love of his life—the one he hadn’t appreciated the
first time around—Brad tries, fails, and tries again to escape the eternal cycle of birth and rebirth. Repeat
answers the question: If you could live half your life over, would you do things differently? Be careful what
you wish for! Repeating is enough to drive a dude crazy.
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From reader reviews:

Jim Weigel:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
thus. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new data.
When you read a guide you will get new information simply because book is one of several ways to share the
information or even their idea. Second, looking at a book will make an individual more imaginative. When
you reading through a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring that you imagine the story how
the people do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to others. When you read this Repeat, you
can tells your family, friends as well as soon about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire different ones,
make them reading a reserve.

Willie Blackburn:

It is possible to spend your free time to see this book this e-book. This Repeat is simple to create you can
read it in the area, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not have much space to bring typically the
printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can save typically the
book in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Billy Shaner:

A lot of e-book has printed but it differs. You can get it by net on social media. You can choose the most
effective book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is referred to as
of book Repeat. You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it can add your
knowledge and make a person happier to read. It is most critical that, you must aware about book. It can
bring you from one spot to other place.

Tony Sanford:

Guide is one of source of understanding. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen need book to know the up-date information of year to be able to year. As we know those
textbooks have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, could also bring us to around the world.
With the book Repeat we can acquire more advantage. Don't someone to be creative people? For being
creative person must like to read a book. Simply choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't
end up being doubt to change your life with this book Repeat. You can more appealing than now.
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