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Marcus Cooper is right where he wants to be in his young life. He's just graduated from college and about to
start an exciting and promising career in diplomacy. He truly believes that he can help make the world a
better place, but he's about to find out that the road to peace requires a heavy toll. After traveling to
Afghanistan with a DOD sponsored contractor outfit, Blue Leaf, Marcus starts a breakneck descent into a
world of intelligence analysis, guerrilla warfare, and espionage. Packed with smart action and clandestine
information gathering, Marcus Cooper's story in Captive Retribution follows the protagonist and his
coworkers into a world where every answer only leads to more questions and their actions begin to set the
stage for something they could have never predicted. One thing is for certain though: this is not what Marcus
thought life after college would be like. Five years after Marcus's story begins, a man will wake up in a
puddle of his own blood. He calls himself Winters and his life has just taken a traumatic turn for the worst.
With his psyche shattered and his body broken, he comes to the realization that while he can't make what's
happened to him right, he can get even. Four men are responsible for the murder of Winters's family. In
destroying something innocent, they have just created a monster. With a gritty plot and a ruthless
protagonist, the second story of Captive Retribution focuses on one man's vendetta to get revenge on those
who did him wrong. With nothing left to lose, Winters goes on a bloody rampage that takes him across
Europe and into the Middle East. As he relentlessly moves from target to target, leaving destruction and
chaos in his wake, Winters can't help but ask one question: has he become worse than the men who killed his
family?
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From reader reviews:

Daniel Buch:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Yep, you
can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a
wander, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book titled Captive
retribution (Volume 1)? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You recognize beside you can spend your
time with your favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with it is opinion or you
have different opinion?

Patrick Taylor:

Captive retribution (Volume 1) can be one of your basic books that are good idea. All of us recommend that
straight away because this book has good vocabulary that could increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to
understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The article author giving his/her
effort that will put every word into delight arrangement in writing Captive retribution (Volume 1) although
doesn't forget the main stage, giving the reader the hottest in addition to based confirm resource info that
maybe you can be among it. This great information can easily drawn you into new stage of crucial
pondering.

Richard Byrnes:

This Captive retribution (Volume 1) is great reserve for you because the content that is certainly full of
information for you who also always deal with world and still have to make decision every minute. That
book reveal it info accurately using great plan word or we can declare no rambling sentences within it. So if
you are read it hurriedly you can have whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only gives you straight forward
sentences but tricky core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having Captive retribution (Volume
1) in your hand like having the world in your arm, information in it is not ridiculous one particular. We can
say that no publication that offer you world with ten or fifteen minute right but this publication already do
that. So , it is good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt that?

Edna Vachon:

This Captive retribution (Volume 1) is brand new way for you who has fascination to look for some
information as it relief your hunger of knowledge. Getting deeper you upon it getting knowledge more you
know or perhaps you who still having tiny amount of digest in reading this Captive retribution (Volume 1)
can be the light food for you because the information inside this specific book is easy to get by means of
anyone. These books produce itself in the form that is reachable by anyone, that's why I mean in the e-book
type. People who think that in reserve form make them feel tired even dizzy this book is the answer. So there
is no in reading a book especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for you.
So , don't miss the item! Just read this e-book style for your better life along with knowledge.
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