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Originating as a radio series in 1933, the Lone Ranger is a cross-media star who has appeared in comic
strips, comic books, adult and juvenile novels, feature films and serials, clothing, games, toys, home
furnishings, and many other consumer products. In his prime, he rivaled Mickey Mouse as one of the most
successfully licensed and merchandised children's properties in the United States, while in more recent
decades, the Lone Ranger has struggled to resonate with consumers, leading to efforts to rebrand the
property. The Lone Ranger's eighty-year history as a lifestyle brand thus offers a perfect case study of how
the fields of licensing, merchandizing, and brand management have operated within shifting industrial and
sociohistorical conditions that continue to redefine how the business of entertainment functions.

Deciphering how iconic characters gain and retain their status as cultural commodities, Selling the Silver
Bullet focuses on the work done by peripheral consumer product and licensing divisions in selectively
extending the characters' reach and in cultivating investment in these characters among potential
stakeholders. Tracing the Lone Ranger's decades-long career as intellectual property allows Avi Santo to
analyze the mechanisms that drive contemporary character licensing and entertainment brand management
practices, while at the same time situating the licensing field's development within particular sociohistorical
and industrial contexts. He also offers a nuanced assessment of the ways that character licensing firms and
consumer product divisions have responded to changing cultural and economic conditions over the past
eighty years, which will alter perceptions about the creative and managerial authority these ancillary units
wield.
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From reader reviews:

Kayla Merritt:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the headline Selling the Silver
Bullet: The Lone Ranger and Transmedia Brand Licensing (Texas Film and Media Studies) suitable to you?
The actual book was written by well known writer in this era. The particular book untitled Selling the Silver
Bullet: The Lone Ranger and Transmedia Brand Licensing (Texas Film and Media Studies)is the main one
of several books in which everyone read now. This specific book was inspired a number of people in the
world. When you read this e-book you will enter the new shape that you ever know previous to. The author
explained their thought in the simple way, therefore all of people can easily to know the core of this e-book.
This book will give you a large amount of information about this world now. So that you can see the
represented of the world within this book.

Anna Sanders:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their down time with their
family, or their own friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, planning to beach, or
picnic from the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different to
fill your personal free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book might be option to fill your totally free time/
holiday. The first thing you ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want to try out look
for book, may be the reserve untitled Selling the Silver Bullet: The Lone Ranger and Transmedia Brand
Licensing (Texas Film and Media Studies) can be excellent book to read. May be it is usually best activity to
you.

William McNeill:

Selling the Silver Bullet: The Lone Ranger and Transmedia Brand Licensing (Texas Film and Media
Studies) can be one of your nice books that are good idea. Most of us recommend that straight away because
this book has good vocabulary which could increase your knowledge in terminology, easy to understand, bit
entertaining however delivering the information. The writer giving his/her effort to place every word into
satisfaction arrangement in writing Selling the Silver Bullet: The Lone Ranger and Transmedia Brand
Licensing (Texas Film and Media Studies) although doesn't forget the main point, giving the reader the
hottest as well as based confirm resource details that maybe you can be one of it. This great information can
easily drawn you into completely new stage of crucial contemplating.

Ronald Marinelli:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make
you to definitely understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and
soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. Often the book that



recommended to you personally is Selling the Silver Bullet: The Lone Ranger and Transmedia Brand
Licensing (Texas Film and Media Studies) this publication consist a lot of the information on the condition
of this world now. This specific book was represented how can the world has grown up. The terminology
styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer made some exploration when he
makes this book. That is why this book suited all of you.
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