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Extensively revised and updated this edition reflects the progress and developments in the field. With 127
chapters and over 400 contributors this book is a truly comprehensive exposition of the specialty of
psychiatry.

Written by well-known and highly regarded experts from around the world, it takes a patient-centered
approach making it an indispensable resource for all those involved in the care of patients with psychiatric
disorders.

For this new edition, the section on the Neuroscientific Foundations of Psychiatry has been completely
revised, with a new author team recruited by Section Editors Jonathan Polan and Eric Kandel.  The final
section, Special Populations and Clinical Settings, features important new chapters on today’s most urgent
topics, including the homeless, restraint and geriatric psychiatry.

Key features include:

Coverage of the entire field of psychiatry, from psychoanalysis to pharmacology and brain imaging,●

including family relations, cultural influence and change, epidemiology, genetics and behavioral medicine
Clinical vignettes describing current clinical practice in an attractive design●

Numerous figures and tables that facilitate learning and comprehension appear throughout the text●

Clear comparisons of the DSM-IV-TR and ICD-10 criteria for easy understanding in a global context●

Diagnostic and treatment decision trees to help both the novice and experienced reader●

The chapter on Cognitive Behavioral Therapies by Edward Friedman, Michael Thase and Jesse Wright is
freely available.  Please click on Read Excerpt 2 above to read this superb exposition of these important
therapies.
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From reader reviews:

Samuel Travis:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be update about what going on or data even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era that is certainly always change and advance. Some of you
maybe will update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming to
a person is you don't know which one you should start with. This Psychiatry (2 Vol. Set) is our
recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and wish in this
era.

Alan Castorena:

Typically the book Psychiatry (2 Vol. Set) has a lot of information on it. So when you check out this book
you can get a lot of advantage. The book was written by the very famous author. Mcdougal makes some
research just before write this book. This specific book very easy to read you will get the point easily after
scanning this book.

Jeremy Richards:

Why? Because this Psychiatry (2 Vol. Set) is an unordinary book that the inside of the publication waiting
for you to snap it but latter it will zap you with the secret it inside. Reading this book close to it was fantastic
author who all write the book in such remarkable way makes the content on the inside easier to understand,
entertaining technique but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is good for you for not hesitating
having this any longer or you going to regret it. This book will give you a lot of gains than the other book
include such as help improving your proficiency and your critical thinking technique. So , still want to delay
having that book? If I ended up you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.

Joseph Mack:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book
store? Aim to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't assess book by its handle may
doesn't work is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in the
outside appearance likes. Maybe you answer might be Psychiatry (2 Vol. Set) why because the excellent
cover that make you consider in regards to the content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or content
is actually fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly guide you to pick up
this book.
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