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I am the man responsible for the captivity of two women; Roxanne and Juanita.

Roxanne was sent to my little brother in New York City. Their story is in the book 'The Club' on Suzanne
Steele's Amazon author page due to the fact it is a much darker read.
Juanita stayed here with me and this is her story.

When these girls crossed me and stole $100,000 of my money, they sealed their fate.

Hell, that amount of money is nothing to a man in my position; it's the principle.

I am a high ranking Colombian official and being seen as weak is not an option for me.

The one thing that I never counted on: was falling in love with my captive...

This is not just her story, it's mine.

I am disciplined, hard, decisive, powerful, but I am also damaged... and falling in love is NOT an option for
me; or so I thought...
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From reader reviews:

Donna Cook:

Book is usually written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can learn everything you want by a book.
Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important matter to bring us around the world. Alongside
that you can your reading ability was fluently. A guide Rubia will make you to be smarter. You can feel far
more confidence if you can know about anything. But some of you think that open or reading the book make
you bored. It is not necessarily make you fun. Why they can be thought like that? Have you seeking best
book or acceptable book with you?

Lawrence Weatherby:

Reading a book to get new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to learn a book. When you read
a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge,
because book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book
that you have read. If you need to get information about your review, you can read education books, but if
you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these us novel, comics, in addition to soon. The
Rubia provide you with a new experience in reading a book.

Rana Jensen:

This Rubia is brand new way for you who has attention to look for some information because it relief your
hunger associated with. Getting deeper you in it getting knowledge more you know or else you who still
having tiny amount of digest in reading this Rubia can be the light food for you because the information
inside this particular book is easy to get simply by anyone. These books acquire itself in the form and that is
reachable by anyone, yes I mean in the e-book form. People who think that in e-book form make them feel
tired even dizzy this reserve is the answer. So you cannot find any in reading a guide especially this one. You
can find what you are looking for. It should be here for you. So , don't miss the item! Just read this e-book
style for your better life and knowledge.

Bradley Cox:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got college students? We believe that that
concern was given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. And
you know that little person similar to reading or as reading become their hobby. You have to know that
reading is very important and also book as to be the point. Book is important thing to add you knowledge,
except your own teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update in relation to something by book. A
substantial number of sorts of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is this Rubia.
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