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Mother’s Milk, Mother’s Ruin, and Ladies’ Delight. Dutch Courage and Cuckold’s Comfort. These
evocative nicknames for gin hint that it has a far livelier history than the simple and classic martini would
lead you to believe. In this book, Lesley Jacobs Solmonson journeys into gin’s past, revealing that this spirit
has played the role of both hero and villain throughout history.

Taking us back to gin’s origins as a medicine derived from the aromatic juniper berry, Solmonson describes
how the Dutch recognized the berry’s alcoholic possibilities and distilled it into the whiskey-like genever.
She then follows the drink to Britain, where cheap imitations laced with turpentine and other caustic fillers
made it the drink of choice for poor eighteenth-century Londoners. Eventually replaced by the sweetened
Old Tom style and later by London Dry gin, its popularity spread along with the British Empire. As people
today once again embrace classic cocktails like the gimlet and the negroni, gin has reclaimed its place in the
world of mixology. Featuring many enticing recipes, Gin is the perfect gift for cocktail aficionados and
anyone who wants to know whether it should be shaken or stirred.
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From reader reviews:

Margaret Clayton:

What do you about book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material when you require
something to explain what your own problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy particular
person? If you don't have spare time to try and do others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored
faster. And you have extra time? What did you do? Everybody has many questions above. They should
answer that question because just their can do which. It said that about book. Book is familiar on every
person. Yes, it is correct. Because start from on guardería until university need that Gin: A Global History
(Reaktion Books - Edible) to read.

Shawna Vaughn:

The e-book with title Gin: A Global History (Reaktion Books - Edible) has a lot of information that you can
understand it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. This kind of book exist new understanding the
information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world at this point. That is
important to yo7u to be aware of how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you within new
era of the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read that anywhere
you want.

Ann Lemieux:

Reading a book to be new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to learn a book. When you go
through a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge,
mainly because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what forms
of book that you have read. In order to get information about your study, you can read education books, but
if you act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these us novel, comics, in addition to
soon. The Gin: A Global History (Reaktion Books - Edible) will give you a new experience in looking at a
book.

Ronnie Johnson:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you will get it in
e-book technique, more simple and reachable. That Gin: A Global History (Reaktion Books - Edible) can
give you a lot of buddies because by you taking a look at this one book you have factor that they don't and
make you more like an interesting person. This book can be one of a step for you to get success. This e-book
offer you information that probably your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than other make you to
be great men and women. So , why hesitate? Let me have Gin: A Global History (Reaktion Books - Edible).
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