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Know Better, Do Better - 20 Steps to Empowerment and Love! by Philip Allan Turner is the author’s second
book. Maya Angelou stated, “I did then what I knew how to do. Now that I know better, I do better.” This
quote freed the author and allowed him to move forward after the most difficult time in his life. He believes
this quote can provide inspiration to anyone who has made a mistake or fallen down. By knowing better, we
can master ourselves so that we can our best self. After losing his job, his house and his life as he knew it,
the author became severely depressed. He spent three years reading every self-help book he could and
eventually found the Bible. This uplifting book uses spiritual wisdom to describe how we can become the
people God intended us to be. The author made Jesus his life coach and was transformed. Using the Bible
and other spiritual traditions, the author has devised 20 easy steps to love and empowerment. The first book
in this series is called “Know Better, Do Better – How To Lean Into The Light and Be Your Best SELF!”
and provides a complete strategy for living an abundant life. The author got so many positive responses from
the first book; he created this summary version focused solely on the 20 steps. The author puts forward five
main premises throughout his books: 1) We are broken because of the conditioning we have gone through
and the experiences we have lived; 2) There is another path, a more enlightened path; 3) Through effort and
daily practice, we can break out of the programming of the past to rewire our minds to live a better life; 4) As
salvation is not constant, neither is enlightenment. We must constantly strive to stay in the present moment
and on the right Godly path; and 5) When we get better, it’ll get better. The author provides ‘Know Better’
Life Questions, ‘Know Better’ Life Principles along with ‘Know Better’ Empowerment Exercises to help the
reader awaken to his purpose in life. This book can transform your life by challenging old beliefs and
offering simple solutions.
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From reader reviews:

Donna Beckman:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Sure, you
can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a wander,
shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or read a book eligible Know Better, Do Better - 20
Steps to Empowerment and Love!? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You recognize beside you can
spend your time using your favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with it has
the opinion or you have different opinion?

Roxie Lloyd:

Book is to be different for each and every grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content.
As it is known to us that book is very important for us. The book Know Better, Do Better - 20 Steps to
Empowerment and Love! seemed to be making you to know about other know-how and of course you can
take more information. It is very advantages for you. The book Know Better, Do Better - 20 Steps to
Empowerment and Love! is not only giving you much more new information but also to get your friend
when you truly feel bored. You can spend your own personal spend time to read your publication. Try to
make relationship with all the book Know Better, Do Better - 20 Steps to Empowerment and Love!. You
never truly feel lose out for everything in the event you read some books.

Margaret Morales:

The guide untitled Know Better, Do Better - 20 Steps to Empowerment and Love! is the guide that
recommended to you you just read. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to a
person. The language that author use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The
author was did a lot of analysis when write the book, hence the information that they share for you is
absolutely accurate. You also can get the e-book of Know Better, Do Better - 20 Steps to Empowerment and
Love! from the publisher to make you more enjoy free time.

Steven Jones:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their
family, or their friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, gonna beach, or picnic
in the park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something different
to fill your personal free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book can be option to fill your free of charge time/
holiday. The first thing you will ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to test
look for book, may be the publication untitled Know Better, Do Better - 20 Steps to Empowerment and
Love! can be great book to read. May be it may be best activity to you.
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