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It’s time to talk! … and have a cultured conversation.  Providing the truly communicative, deeply
culture-focused approach instructors believe in along with the guidance and tools students need to be
successful using a program with highly communicative goals–with Mosaicos, there is no need to
compromise.  Recognizing the primacy of the relationship between culture and language, the new Sixth
Edition of Mosaicos places culture up front and center, and everywhere in-between!
 
NEW! A new form-focused activity follows the presentation of grammar. Students can do them in class with
the instructor or as online homework before coming to class as all Comprendes activities are machine-
gradable and include immediate feedback when completed within MySpanishLab. In these quick, form-
focused activities students check that they are able to produce the new grammatical forms before moving to
the contextualized and communicative activities. The continuing activity sequence moves students gradually
from meaningful, form-focused activities towards production of open-ended, personalized communication.
The activities focus attention on the communicative purpose of the linguistic structures while invoking
culturally-relevant contexts. All activities require students to process meaning as well as form so that they
develop skill in using their linguistic knowledge to gather information, answer questions, and resolve
problems.
For example, note that the even the form-focused activities require students to process meaning, not just fill
in blank with the correct response, making the connection between meaning and form. For good reason, the



grammar section is called Funciones y formas — a hallmark of the Mosaicos approach!
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From reader reviews:

Jim Moffett:

The book Mosaicos, Volume 1 with MySpanishLab with Pearson eText -- Access Card Package ( One-
semester access) (6th Edition) can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about
everything you want. Why then must we leave the best thing like a book Mosaicos, Volume 1 with
MySpanishLab with Pearson eText -- Access Card Package ( One-semester access) (6th Edition)? Several of
you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim in which book can give many info for us. It is
absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer with the book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, you are
able to give for each other; you could share all of these. Book Mosaicos, Volume 1 with MySpanishLab with
Pearson eText -- Access Card Package ( One-semester access) (6th Edition) has simple shape however, you
know: it has great and large function for you. You can appear the enormous world by start and read a
publication. So it is very wonderful.

Vanessa Palacios:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also be a life style. This reading behavior give you lot of
advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the book
which improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of reserve you
read, if you want get more knowledge just go with education books but if you want truly feel happy read one
along with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. Often the Mosaicos, Volume 1 with
MySpanishLab with Pearson eText -- Access Card Package ( One-semester access) (6th Edition) is kind of
guide which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Henrietta Belcher:

The book Mosaicos, Volume 1 with MySpanishLab with Pearson eText -- Access Card Package ( One-
semester access) (6th Edition) has a lot info on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of advantage.
The book was published by the very famous author. Tom makes some research just before write this book.
That book very easy to read you may get the point easily after perusing this book.

Brenda Luna:

Publication is one of source of knowledge. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen need book to know the upgrade information of year in order to year. As we know
those guides have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the
world. With the book Mosaicos, Volume 1 with MySpanishLab with Pearson eText -- Access Card Package
( One-semester access) (6th Edition) we can have more advantage. Don't one to be creative people? For
being creative person must choose to read a book. Only choose the best book that ideal with your aim. Don't
possibly be doubt to change your life by this book Mosaicos, Volume 1 with MySpanishLab with Pearson



eText -- Access Card Package ( One-semester access) (6th Edition). You can more inviting than now.
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