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R is a powerful and free software system for data analysis and graphics, with over 1,200 add-on packages
available. This book introduces R using SAS and SPSS terms with which you are already familiar. It
demonstrates which of the add-on packages are most like SAS and SPSS and compares them to R’s built-in
functions. It steps through over 30 programs written in all three packages, comparing and contrasting the
packages’ differing approaches. The programs and practice datasets are available for download.

The glossary defines over 50 R terms using SAS/SPSS jargon and again using R jargon. The table of
contents and the index allow you to find equivalent R functions by looking up both SAS statements and
SPSS commands. When finished, you will be able to import data, manage and transform it, create
publication quality graphics, and perform basic statistical analyses.

"This is a really great book. It is easy to read, quite comprehensive, and would be extremely valuable to both
regular R users and users of SAS and SPSS who wish to switch to or learn about R…An invaluable
reference." - David Hitchcock, University of South Carolina

"Thanks for writing R for SAS and SPSS Users--it is a comprehensible and clever document. The graphics
chapter is superb!" - Tony N. Brown, Vanderbilt University

"This is a Rosetta Stone for SPSS and SAS users to start learning R quickly and effectively." - Ralph
O'Brien, ASA Fellow

"I am a professional SAS and SPSS programmer and found this book extremely useful." - Tony Chu, Public
Policy Research Data Analyst
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From reader reviews:

Ronald Castaneda:

With other case, little individuals like to read book R for SAS and SPSS Users (Statistics and Computing).
You can choose the best book if you like reading a book. As long as we know about how is important a new
book R for SAS and SPSS Users (Statistics and Computing). You can add know-how and of course you can
around the world by the book. Absolutely right, since from book you can know everything! From your
country until finally foreign or abroad you will be known. About simple issue until wonderful thing you may
know that. In this era, we are able to open a book or maybe searching by internet unit. It is called e-book.
You can utilize it when you feel bored stiff to go to the library. Let's learn.

Jean McFerren:

Often the book R for SAS and SPSS Users (Statistics and Computing) has a lot of information on it. So when
you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of profit. The book was authored by the very famous
author. The author makes some research just before write this book. This book very easy to read you can
obtain the point easily after scanning this book.

Wesley Binns:

Many people spending their time by playing outside having friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by examining a book.
Ugh, ya think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It okay
you can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like R for SAS and SPSS Users
(Statistics and Computing) which is keeping the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's view.

Adam Mathews:

Is it anyone who having spare time after that spend it whole day by means of watching television programs
or just resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This R for SAS and SPSS Users (Statistics
and Computing) can be the reply, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are so out of date, spending
your time by reading in this brand new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these books have than the
others?
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